
Caroline Patterson concentrates her practice in the areas of 
corporate and business law.  She has represented large to 
mid-sized companies in mergers, asset and stock 
acquisitions, initial public offerings of stock, preferred 
stock offerings and private equity investments.   
 
Ms. Patterson currently specializes in counseling small to 
mid-sized companies in a variety of areas corporate and 
business law.  Ms. Patterson regularly handles sales and 
acquisitions of businesses, private equity investments, 
compliance with corporate governance and contract 
negotiation for her clients.   
 
Ms. Patterson is experienced in drafting organizational 
documents for partnerships, corporations, limited liability 
companies and non-profit corporations. 
 
Ms. Patterson received her Bachelor of Arts degree, magna 
cum laude, from Cabrini College in 1995.  She earned her 
law degree, cum laude, from Villanova University School of 
Law, where she was a Contributing Editor and then 
Managing Editor of the Villanova Law Review.  Ms. 
Patterson is admitted to practice law in Pennsylvania and 
New Jersey.  
 
Professional Associations: 

Pennsylvania Bar Association 

Montgomery County Bar Association 

Community Involvement: 

Advisory Board Member for the Augustinian Volunteers, 
an organization that places and supervises volunteers 
serving in various national and international churches and 
schools. 
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